
CONTACT US :

No. 1, Lintang Delima Satu, 
Greenlane, 11700 
Gelugor, Pulau Pinang

www.sekrijaya.com

+(60)4-655 8969 (Office)

PROJECT
MANAGEMENT
Unveil SEKRIJAYA SDN. BHD.’s
prestigious selection of featured
projects, showcasing our exceptional
craftsmanship and innovative solutions.

INDUSTRIAL
SECTORS

OUR INDUSTRIAL PROJECTS

OUR RECENT FEATURED
PROJECTS HAVE
GARNERED NATIONWIDE
RECOGNITION

Explore our featured, completed,
and ongoing industrial projects
that exemplify our commitment to
delivering exceptional
construction, renovation, and
interior design solutions. Discover
our track record of excellence and
be inspired by our portfolio of
remarkable achievements.

We have handled more than 400
industrial project management,
construction, renovation, interior
design builder projects since 2001

APPLIED
ENGINEERING

LGI 
TECHNOLOGY



WHAT SET US APART
FROM THE REST?

MOTOROLATRAVELODGE

WHY US?
Our commitment to delivering

exceptional results on time and
within budget sets Sekrijaya 

apart from others in the industry.
Sekrijaya's skilled team ensures
seamless project coordination,

tailoring solutions to clients'
needs, and proactively 

preventing delays. 
Trusted excellence assured.

Sekrijaya stands out as a premier
provider of industrial construction

project management services,
offering unparalleled expertise and

dedication to excellence. 

There are several advantages of
Sekrijaya Sdn. Bhd. compared to

others competitor in the industry

UNCOMPROMISING
QUALITY WHERE

IMPECCABLE EXECUTION
MEETS EXCELLENCE

Expert Team:

Efficient Coordination

Tailored Solutions:

Proactive Problem-Solving

Client-Centric Approach

ANSELL, KULIM


